



Fremont County Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road • Cañon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120

3/25/2025

Tack Oil Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

SS1H tack oil to **Suncor Energy (\$2.34 per gallon) (\$1.57 per gallon 50/50 dilute)** from their Pueblo, Colo. plant for the asphalt project. FCDOT will deliver to jobsite.

Bid Opening:
3/13/2025

ASPHALT & TACK

Bidder:	Spec 1 <u>1/2" SX ASPHALT/PLANT</u>	Spec 2 <u>1/2" SX ASPHALT/CANON CITY</u>	Spec 3 <u>TACK OIL / PLANT SS-1H</u>	Spec 4 <u>TACK OIL / CANON CITY SS-1H</u>
UNITED COMPANIES	\$82.00	\$92.00	NO BID	NO BID
SUNCOR	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.34 Gallon \$1.57 50/50 Dilute Gallon	\$2.57 Gallon \$1.80 50/50 Dilute Gallon
MARTIN MARIETTA	\$75.75	NO BID	\$5.00	NO BID
BLACK ROCK	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.24	\$3.47

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO PURCHASE ORDER

P. O. No. **41591**

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CAÑON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE 3/25/2025
 VENDOR: Suncor Energy
 ADDRESS: _____

SHIP TO: (Department making request)
FCDOT

QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	ACCOUNT CODE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
<u>2648</u>	<u>SSHT Tackoil</u>	<u>04.431.420100</u>	<u>2.34</u>	<u>6,191.13</u>
TOTAL AMOUNT				<u>6,191.13</u>

Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996

 Department Head Date

I certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper and authorized within this Department Budget, and I have followed the Fremont County Procurement Policy.

 County Manager Date

Date

 Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
 YELLOW — Finance Office Copy
 PINK — Department Copy





Fremont County Department of Transportation



1170 Red Canyon Road • Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) 1/2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ 82⁰⁰ /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 839 Mackenzie Ave

2.) 1/2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ 92⁰⁰ /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil \$ No Bid /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: _____

4.) Tack Oil \$ No Bid /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: March 2025

Company Name: United Companies

Phone Number: 719-275-3264 / 719-851-0086

Signature: Jos Naranjo

Date: 3/11/2025



Fremont County Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road • Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120



Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ _____/Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: _____

2.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ _____/Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil: CSS-1H = \$2.34/gal or \$555/ton at the Plant.

Tack Oil: CSS-1H Dilute 50/50= \$1.57/gal or \$370/ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 510 West D Street, Pueblo, CO 81003

4.) Tack Oil CSS-1H=\$2.57/gal or \$610/ton Delivered to Canon City.

Tack Oil CSS-1H Dilute 50/50=\$1.80/gal or \$425/ton Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: April 15, 2025

Company Name: Suncor Energy USA Inc.

Phone Number: 720-534-8595

Signature: _____

Jim Agell

Date: _____

3-7-25

CONTACT INFORMATION

Robin Arends

Southern Asphalt Outside Sales / Special Projects

Martin Marietta

1910 Rand Ave.

Colorado Springs, CO 80905

t. (719) 591-3300 m. (719) 342-1189

e. robin.arends@martinmarietta.com

www.martinmarietta.com



✓

Fremont County Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road • Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ 75.75 /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: PUEBLO plant 615 SANTA FE, Pueblo, HWY 85/87
Plant 3965 HWY 85/87 Colorado Springs, CAPITAL Plant 2725 Capital Dr.
Colorado Springs

2.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ N/A /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil \$ 5.00 /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: Pueblo Plant 615 Santa Fe Dr. Pueblo, Hwy 85/87 3965
Hwy 85/87 Colorado Springs.

4.) Tack Oil \$ N/A /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: We have a plant active now weather permitting. _____

Company Name: Martin Marietta

Phone Number: 719-342-1189

Signature: _____

Date: 2-13-2025



Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road • Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ 75.75 /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: PUEBLO plant 615 SANTA FE, Pueblo, HWY 85/87
Plant 3965 HWY 85/87 Colorado Springs, CAPITAL Plant 2725 Capital Dr.
Colorado Springs

2.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ N/A /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil \$ 5.00 /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: Pueblo Plant 615 Santa Fe Dr. Pueblo, Hwy 85/87 3965
Hwy 85/87 Colorado Springs.

4.) Tack Oil \$ N/A /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: We have a plant active now weather permitting. _____

Company Name: Martin Marietta

Phone Number: 719-342-1189

Signature: _____

Date: 2-13-2025



Fremont County Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road • Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 • Fax: 719-275-2120



Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ No Bid /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: _____

2.) ½" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt \$ No Bid /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil \$ 3.24 /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 5301 Bannock St. Denver, CO 80216

4.) Tack Oil \$ 3.47 /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: Approx. Jan 6th-Dec 15th

Company Name: Black Rock Material & Supply, LLC

Phone Number: 303-591-6275

Signature: 

Josh Krueger, Vice President

Date: 3/13/25





COBITCO, Inc. • 5301 Bannock St. • Denver, CO 80216 • 303.296.8575 • Fax 303.297.3029

PRODUCT SPECIFICATION

Cationic Emulsified Asphalt CSS-1h

Meeting the Requirements of
AASHTO M208 and ASTM D2397

Tests on Emulsion:

	<u>Min</u>	<u>Max</u>
Viscosity, Saybolt Furol at 25°C (77°F), s	20	100
Storage Stability Test, 24h, percent ^A		1
Particle charge test		positive
Sieve test, percent ^A		0.10
Cement mixing test, percent		2.0
Distillation:		
Residue, percent	57	

Tests on residue from distillation test:

Penetration, 25°C (77°F), 100 g, 5 s	40	90
Ductility, 25°C (77°C), 5 cm/min, cm	40	
Solubility in trichloroethylene, percent	97.5	

^AThis test requirement on representative samples may be waived if successful application of the material has been achieved in the field.

Test methods will meet the requirements of AASHTO M208 and ASTM D2397
