Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Cafion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/22/2022

Aggregate Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

7" aggregate chip rock (§15.75/ton) to The Aggregate Source (Canon City) for chip seal.
/2”aggregate chip rock ($18.75/ton) to The Aggregate Source (Canon City) for chip seal.

Fremont County will pick up aggregate at the quarry.



FREMONT GOUNTY GOLORADO P.O. Ne 41215
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE 7/22 /7/7 cl SHIP TO: (Department making request)
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Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996
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Department Head Date

| certlfy that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the
Fremont County Procurement Policy.

County Manager Date

Date

Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
YELLOW — Finance Office Copy
PINK — Department Copy



Bid Opening:

AGGREGATE

March 10, 2022

T spec1 | spec? Spec3 Speca Specs Specé ~ spec7 Specs " Specd Speci0 | Specil
Bidder: 1/2"QUARRY 5/8"QUARRY 3/4"QUARRY 3/4" 6251 CR 28 3/4" 1240 McKinley = 3/4" 1170 Red Canyon Rd 5/8" 6251 CR 28 1/2" 1170 Red Canyon Rd

TEZAK $18.75 |NO BID| $15.75 $22.50 $18.40 $18.85 NO BID $21.85
MARTIN MARIETTA NO BID | NOBID| $21.00 $27.00 $26.95 $26.85 NO BID NO BID




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Aggregate

1)  1/2” Rock $_18.75 [Ton at Quarry.

2) 5/8"Rock $_ NoBid  /Ton at Quarry.

3.) 3/4”Rock $_15.75 [Ton at Quarry.

4) 3/4” Rock $22.50 [Ton Delivered to 6251 CR 28 (Indian Park Pit).

5) 3/4” Rock $18.40 [Ton Delivered to 1240 McKinley St. Canon City

6.) 3/4” Rock $18.85 [Ton Delivered to 1170 Red Canyon Rd. Canon City
7.) 5/8”" Rock $ NoBid  /Ton Delivered to 6251 CR 28 (Indian Park Pit).

8.) 1/2” Rock $21.85 /Ton Delivered to 1170 Red Canyon Rd. Canon City

Quarry address is: 205 Tunnel Drive

Canon City, CO 81212

Company Name: _Tezak Heavy Equipment- THE Aggregate Source

Phone Number: ~ 719-371-7272
V2 P/ Ben Pierce- Sales and Marketing Ass.

Signature:

Date: 03/08/2022




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Aggregate

1)  1/2” Rock $ Mo ;4 rTon at Quarry.

2) 5/8” Rock $_No [3; d Ton at Quarry.

3) 3/4”Rock $__ 2 1.09Ton at Quarry.

4.) 3/4” Rock $ 27.00 [Ton Delivered to 6251 CR 28 (Indian Park Pit).

5.) 3/4” Rock $ 26. _5 ITon Delivered to 1240 McKinley St. Canon City
6.) 3/4” Rock $ 26.85 [Ton Delivered to 1170 Red Canyon Rd. Canon City
7)) 5/8” Rock $ 6/A [Ton Delivered to 6251 CR 28 (Indian Park Pit).

8.) 1/2” Rock $ “_/0 E/A [Ton Delivered to 1170 Red Canyon Rd. Canon City

Quarry address is: W2 (&) 57 ; Cothon C,l"!'\? , (0L \2\2-

Company Name: N\gf‘hr\ M&r'; e)Vro\ ~ L-M(‘o~ Beas (‘C(f
Phone Number: N9- 258- 04 14

Signature: W
Date: Q—/l 5 /2%




. Account Name : FREMONT COUNTY DOT

Martln Account Number : 811210

Mariettc Customer Address: 1170 RED CANYON, CANON CITY, CO 81212, US
Customer Contact:

Project Name: FREMONT COUNTY 2022

] Quote ID: 50074338
';;‘;Jg‘:; ”(‘jddcreSS: r Quote Date: 2/15/2022

ed Canyon iration: 17/202
Caion City, CO 81212, FREMONT County QuelsEpirtion 31712022

Martin Marietta is pleased to quote prices on the following products for the above listed project:

' J ' ‘Total
Product

Product o Quantity UM T Price

Per Unit

57/67 CRUSHED ROCK - WASHED m Parkdale Quarry

PAYMENT TERMS NET 30 FROM DATE OF INVOICE

THE FOLLOWING PRICING IS FOR ACCEPTANCE BY THE QUOTE EXPIRATION DATE LISTED ABOVE. IF NOT ACCEPTED BY THE ABOVE
DATE, ALL PRICES STATED HEREIN ARE VALID ONLY AT THE OPTION OF MARTIN MARIETTA MATERIALS INC.

ALL SALES ARE PRESUMED TO BE TAXABLE UNLESS AND UNTIL A COMPLETE AND ACCURATE SALES TAX EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE IS
RECEIVED. QUOTED PRICES DO NOT INCLUDE SALES TAX.

Haul rate to 6251 CR 28 = $6.00/ton for semis
Haul rate to 1240 McKinley St. = $5.95/ton for semis

After the first 15 minutes wait at the jobsite the trucks will charge an hourly wait time of $110/hour plus any fuel surcharge.

ALL MATERIAL BASED ON ENGINEERS APPROVAL AND PLANT AVAILABILITY.
End Dump Haul Rates Quoted Above:
Should your project require alternate truck types, the following additional costs will be added to the haul charge:
Belly Dump requests will not incur any additional haul charge.
Side Dump requests will incur an additional 8% haul charge.
Live Fioors requests will incur an additional 10% haul charge.
Tandem requests will incur an additional 47% haul charge.
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. Account Name : FREMONT COUNTY DOT
A Martin Account Number : 811210
Marietta Customer Address: 1170 RED CANYON, CANON CITY, CO 81212, US
Customer Contact:

without regard to principles of conflict or choice of law.

BY SIGNING BELOW OR ACCEPTING PRODUCTS SOLD BY MARTIN MARIETTA, THE CUSTOMER AGREES TO BE BOUND BY THE
TERMS AND CONDITIONS FOLLOWING THIS SIGNATURE LINE:

Signature Print Name Date

Should you have any questions concerning this quote, please contact
LAURA BEASLEY at (719) 258-0414 or Laura.Beasley@martinmarietta.com
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