Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Cafion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/22/2022

Asphalt Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

72” SX Asphalt mix to Fremont Paving ($66.00/Ton) for the asphalt projects. Fremont County
will deliver to job sites.



FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO P.O. N°o 41211
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE j/ﬂz /702 Z SHIP TO: (Department making request)
VENDOR: FCM(M}L }%v;m /'Cb 0T Wi /[ fpx(,é V{D

ADDRESS: &5 7 /Zr, mue,
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QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT CODE UNIT PRICE TOTAL
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TOTAL AMOUNT / /fé <14 =
/ Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996 4
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Department Head Date

| certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the
Fremont County Procurement Policy.

County Manager Date

Date

Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
YELLOW — Finance Office Copy

PINK — Department Copy
@@%ﬁ 3



Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Caiion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/22/2022

Tack Qil Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

SS1H tack oil to Suncor Energy ($1.18 per gallon) (50/50 dilute) from their Pueblo, Colo. plant
for the asphalt project. FCDOT will deliver to jobsite.



FREMONT GOUNTY COLORADO P.O. N2 41212
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE J cZ éﬂ e SHIP TO: (Department making request)
VENDOR:. / sz 0.
ADDRESS:
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT CODE UNIT PRICE TOTAL
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TOTAL AMOUNT 4{2 7y 2
Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996
% %ﬁ/a :?é z/?& zz
/ = Department Head Date

I certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the
Fremont County Procurement Policy.

County Manager Date

Date

Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
YELLOW — Finance Office Copy
PINK — Department Copy




Bid Opening: ASPHALT & TACK OIL
3/10/2022
Spec1 Spec 2 Spec 3 Spec 4
Bidder: 1/2" SX ASPHALT/PLANT 1/2" SX ASPHALT/CANON CITY TACK OIL / PLANT TACK OIL / CANON CITY
SS-1H SS-1H
FREMONT PAVING $66.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gallon
MARTIN MARIETTA $61.50 NO BID $5.00 NO BID
Gallon Gallon
SUNCOR NO BID NO BID $2.23 $2.41
$1.18 50/50 Dilute $1.35 50/50 Dilute
COBITCO NO BID NO BID I $2.99 $3.40




I, Asphah Tack Bid Sheet pdF
L&« BidBoard . :[remont Counly HMA ° ws Files column 7

o
o
Fremont County @
Department of Transportation
1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City. Colorado 81212 ,(?

Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack OQil

1.) %2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ é(; /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: Z( ; l !fs M,&,‘Az s d A[g,

2.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt § ’.__ /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3) Tack Qit§_ — /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: -

4)) Tack Oil $ — /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.
Approximate date asphalt will be available: —

Company Name:

Phone Number: ZG-2LE-D

Signature: %ﬂ%&
Date: Q}I Zgz? Z 2032




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $61.50 [Ton at the Plant.

2.) ¥;” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ NA /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil $3 5.00 /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 615 Santa Fe DFrive, Pueblo CO 81006

4,) Tack Oil $NA /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: 3/15/2022

Company Name: MARTIN MARIETTA

Phone Number:  719-342-1189

Signature: W

Date: 2/15/2022




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road ¢ Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) 2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) 2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ [Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil CSS-1H: $2.23/Gal or $528/Ton at the Plant.
Tack Oil CSS-1H Dilute 50/50: $1.18/Gal or $279/Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 510 West D Street, Pueblo, CO 81002

4.) Tack Oil CSS-1H: $2.41/Gal or $569/Ton Delivered to Canon City.
Tack Oil CSS-1H Dilute 50/50: $1.35/Gal or $320/Ton Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: April 15, 2022

Company Name: Suncor Energy (USA) Inc.

Phone Number: 303-793-8009

Signature: Oxﬂrx %/j/j/

/7
Date: / Q.e.Q.S‘-ZL




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 » Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ NO BID /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) 2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ No BiD _ /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil$ 2.99  /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: _530) BANANOCK. ST QE&!LE,CQ BO24L

4) Tack 0il$_3.40 /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: Yerar Roonp

Company Name: CoBrmco INe,
Phone Number: C&Qﬁ) 29 - 8575 J/\/303)884--l095

Signature: /L{}‘“g 7%}—-‘%

Date: 035/ :q/mz.z_




