Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Carion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/26/2024

Asphalt Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

/2” SX Asphalt mix to Fremont Paving ($75.00/Ton) for the asphalt projects. Fremont County
will deliver to job sites.



Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

February 14, 2024

To Whom It May Concern:
RE: Asphalt & Tack oil Bid

Fremont County is accepting sealed bids for %" SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt
Material With reference to CDOT Specs & Tack Oil. Bids will be as follows:

Bid #1 shall include cost per ton at vendors’ location.

Bid #2 shall include cost per ton delivered to Canon City.
Bid #3 shall include cost per Gallon at vendors’ location.
Bid #4 shall include cost per Gallon delivered to Canon City.

Sealed bids must be received by 1:00 p.m. March 14, 2024 at the Fremont County
Manager’s office, 615 Macon Ave, Room 106, Canon City, Colorado 81212. Dates of
delivery will be scheduled through the FCDOT Supervisors.

Sealed bids must be submitted on the bid form supplied, be signed, and contain
completed contact information. Fremont County reserves the right to refuse or
reject any/all bids.

Thank you,
Michael Whitt

DOT Director
FCDOT

Please e-mail confirmation michael.whitt@fremontco.com
If you have any questions call me @ 719-276-7430




Bid Opening: ASPHALT & TACK OIL

3/21/2024
R Spec1 Spec 2 Spec 3 Spec4d
Bidder: 1/2" SX ASPHALT/PLANT 1/2" SX ASPHALT/CANON CITY TACK OlL / PLANT TACK OIL / CANON CITY
s S
FREMONT PAVING $75.00 $85.00 NO BID | I NO BID
Gallon
MARTIN MARIETTA(CO Springs) $75.00 NO BID $5.00 NO BID
MARTIN MARIETTA(Pueblo) $75.00 NO BID $5.00 NO BID
SUNCOR NO BID | | NO BID | $2.41 I $2.60
i $1.61 50/50 Dilute $1.80 50/50 Dilute
COBITCO NO BID NO BID $3.50 l $3.75




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

o0
1.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ 'er [Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 8% ¢ !%L&Qz.kv_zéf—

a0
2.) 2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ 85 — ITon Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil $ Ao B[d /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

4.) Tack Oil $_/)» fRid IGallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available:

Company Name: Egﬂogi E;Q‘Qﬂ 4—214/‘ ~Aix

Phone Number: Z[Z-élé-— Zéﬂ

Signature: @%_@é@»«bﬂjﬂ

Date: 2/ 224

paogy




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) 2 SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $_ 75.00 /Ton at the Plant.
Plant Location Address: 3965 Hwy 85/87, COLORADO SPRINGS, CO 80911

2.) 2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphait $ N/A ITon Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil $5.00 /Gallon at the Plant.
Plant Location Address: 3965 Hwy 85/87, COLORADO SPR'NGS, CO 80911

4.) Tack Oil $N/A IGallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: MARCH 15 2024

Company Name: MARTIN MARIETTA

Phone Number: 71 9—;342—1 189

Signature: “ '\F_. \71 >

e
Date: 2-19-24




FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO P.O. No 41350
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE glal‘o/ 2 SHIP TO: (Department making request)

VENDOR: _< kﬂ | M‘ld QJUL n/ DO -

ADDRESS: & DY mO‘L('J’ﬂlZ/MJ% (WD ZV\ ( dr|pn M
Con Cly Ay Fplo (wwn (1 (O Faln

QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT CODE UNIT PRICE TOTAL

12601 G- 47130 % 00[T197,500.00

TOTAL AMOUNT Q7 E0. 06

Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996

;%4%%) 3-21-24

Department Head Date

| certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the
Fremont County Procurement Policy.

County Manager Date
Date
Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
YELLOW — Finance Office Copy

PINK — Department Copy
®@' 3



