Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Carfion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/28/2023

Tack Oil Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

SS1H tack oil to Suncor Energy ($2.41 per gallon) ($1.61 per gallon 50/50 dilute) from their
Pueblo, Colo. plant for the asphalt project. FCDOT will deliver to jobsite.



Bid Opening: TACK OIL
3/16/2023

" Spec1 Spec 2 Spec 3 Spec 4
Bidder: 1/2" SX ASPHALT/PLANT  1/2" SX ASPHALT/CANON CITY TACK OIL / PLANT TACK OIL / CANON CITY
s ss1m
FREMONT PAVING $85.00 NO BID | NO BID I NO BID
Gallon
MARTIN MARIETTA $68.00 NO BID | $4.00 NO BID
Gallon Gallon
SUNCOR NO BID NO BID I $2.41 $2.60
$1.61 50/50 Dilute $1.80 50/50 Dilute
COBITCO NO BID NO BID I $3.50 I $3.75




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ¥2"” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalit $ [Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ [Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil: CSS-1H = $2.41/gal or $567/ton at the Plant.
Tack Oil: CSS-1H Dilute 50/50 = $1.61/gal or $380/ton at the Plant.
Plant Location Address: 510 West D Street, Pueblo, CO 81002

4.) Tack Oil CSS-1H = $2.60/gal or $612/ton Delivered to Canon City.
Tack Oil CSS-1H Dilute 50/50 = $1.80/gal or $425/ton Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: April 15, 2023

Company Name: Suncor Energy USA Inc.
Phone Number: 303-793-8009

Signature: O—M\ /70/ a’\

P

Date: March 7, 2!%



Fremont County \/

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) 2" SX Standard Mix Design Asphait $ Afa Srf [Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) 2" 8X Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ gf/[ B, J__[Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oii $_-> I3 U 3.50 /Gallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 530[ /!/ BQ[/HA(J(/( ‘Sﬁ
Denver CQ 8B22/¢

4.) TackOil $_3. 7 /Gallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: A/J 7|/ c"r/‘fr/ ,{)8 i 1 Lak/ meo ferm/ -
’ Avalah | f/

Company Name: {1 [ TL( o Linc.,

Phone Number: { 03)276-85758

sonawre: _ALlwe Dsidilf

Date: /'.ﬂ‘(;;:![ o/ /3 2023




LoBiTco
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EMULSIFIED ASPHALT

5307 Bannock Street « Denver, CO 80216 « (303) 296-8575

MEMO 2023

Due to the market instability for crude oil and petroleum products,
COBITCO Inc. bid proposal price is subject to change every
month beginning March 1% 2023. Pricing will be based on the
current refinery asphalt cement price the first day of each month.
Cobitco Inc. is unable to purchase asphalt cement with a firm price
beyond 30 days. [ will contact you if any changes occur during the

year. Thank you.



LoBiTCo
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EMULSIFIED ASPHALT

ADDENDUM 2023

DEMURRAGE CHARGES:

2 hours of tree unloading. after that it will be $85.00 per hour for detention of tanker truck.
Demurrage charges will be billed in quarter hour increments of $21.25 each.

PUMP CHARGE:

[f a pump is required there will be no charge.

SPREADING CHARGES:

Spreading charges will begin at the time the spreader truck is ready to spread material and until the
spreader truck is released from the job for that day. The rate of spreading will be as follows:

$255.00 per hour with a FOUR-HOUR MINIMUM

MINIMUM DELIVERY:

48.000 Pounds (24 Tons, or approximately 5.647 gallons per tanker load).

For COBITCO, Inc. Distributor Truck Only:
20.000 Pounds (10 Tons. or approximately 2.353 Gallons).

FREIGHT CHARGES:

Available upon request, loads that cross the continental divide will be charged mountain ratcs.
*Rates subject to weekly Fuel Surcharge. Minimum 24 ton,

*If gallons delivered are less than the minimum delivery. freight charges will be billed at 5,600
gallons (tanker minimum load requirement).

*Demurrage charges and freight quotes per PTI Trucking. If another trucking company is used.
prices and policy may vary. These quotes are good for the year 2023.

COBITCO, Inc. + 5301 Bannock St. = Denver, CO 80216 - 303.296.8575 « Fax 303.297.3029



FREMONT COUNTY GOLORADO P.O. Ne 41275
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

DATE ?) ! % l 3633 SHIP TO: (Department making request)
O _DOT

VENDOR: .
ADDRESS: ) LU szQ\S) (Qﬂé{f@ 4 )Qd
(Lowoi Coly (D Paip
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT CODE UNIT PRICE TOTAL

2,65 [Tk O 4180 8. 4 Jog| K705

TOTAL AMOUNT 4 ﬂ > (jfj_

/ Colorado Sales Tax fxempt #98-04996
' ;?é Ro2>

Department Head Date

I certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the
Fremont County Procurement Policy.

County Manager Date
Date
Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy
YELLOW — Finance Office Copy

PINK — Department Copy .
®@}‘T"D3




