Fremont County
Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Cafion City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

3/26/2024

Tack Oil Bids:

Fremont County Department of Transportation recommendation for Award of bid as follows:

SSTH tack oil to Suncor Energy ($2.41 per gallon) ($1.61 per gallon 50/50 dilute) from their
Pueblo, Colo. plant for the asphalt project. FCDOT will deliver to jobsite.



Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road  Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

February 14, 2024

To Whom It May Concern:
RE: Asphalt & Tack oil Bid

Fremont County is accepting sealed bids for %’ SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt
Material With reference to CDOT Specs & Tack Oil. Bids will be as follows:

Bid #1 shall include cost per ton at vendors’ location.

Bid #2 shall include cost per ton delivered to Canon City.

Bid #3 shall include cost per Gallon at vendors’ location.

Bid #4 shall include cost per Gallon delivered to Canon City.

Sealed bids must be received by 1:00 p.m. March 14, 2024 at the Fremont County
Manager’s office, 615 Macon Ave, Room 106, Canon City, Colorado 81212. Dates of
delivery will be scheduled through the FCDOT Supervisors.

Sealed bids must be submitted on the bid form supplied, be signed, and contain
completed contact information. Fremont County reserves the right to refuse or
reject any/all bids.

Thank you,
Michael Whitt

DOT Director
FCDOT

Please e-mail confirmation michael.whitt@fremontco.com
If you have any questions call me @ 719-276-7430




Bid Opening: ASPHALT & TACK OIL
3/21/2024

; Spec1 Spec 2 Spec 3 Spec 4
Bidder: 1/2" SX ASPHALT/PLANT 1/2" SX ASPHALT/CANON CITY TACK OIL / PLANT TACK OIL / CANON CITY
SS-1H SS-1H
FREMONT PAVING $75.00 $85.00 NO BID I NO BID
Gallon
MARTIN MARIETTA(CO Springs) $75.00 NO BID $5.00 NO BID
MARTIN MARIETTA(Pueblo) $75.00 i l NO BID $5.00 | NO BID
SUNCOR NO BID NO BID $2.41 | I $2.60
$1.61 50/50 Dilute $1.80 50/50 Dilute
COBITCO I NO BID NO BID $3.50 $3.75




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) »” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $_75.00 ITon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 615 Santa Fe DFrive, Pueblo CO 81006

2.) % SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ N/A ITon Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil $5.00 IGallon at the Plant.

Plant Location Address: 615 Santa Fe DFrive, Pueblo CO 81006

4.) Tack Oil $N/A IGallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: MARCH 15 2024

Company Name: MARTIN MARIETTA

Phone Number: 719-_ 42-1189

<

Signature: -\ dy,

Date: 2-19-24




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $ /Ton Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Qil: CSS-1H =$2.41/gal or $567/ton at the Plant.
Tack Oil: CSS-1H Dilute 50/50 = $1.61/gal or $380/ton at the Plant
Plant Location Address: 510 West D Street, Pueblo, CO 81003

4.) Tack Oil CSS-1H = $2.60/gal or $613/ton Delivered to Canon City.
Tack Oil CSS-1H Dilute 50/50 = $1.80/gal or $425/ton Delivered to Canon
City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: April 15, 2024.

Company Name: Suncor Energy USA Inc.

Phone Number: 303-793-8009

Signature: 0’ S WV[ “\l»é/

Date: 3 hs 2"1




Fremont County

Department of Transportation

1170 Red Canyon Road e Canon City, Colorado 81212
Phone: 719-276-7430 e Fax: 719-275-2120

Bid sheet: Asphalt and Tack Oil

1.) ¥2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $4{&£ 5@’ /Ton at the Plant.

Plant Location Address:

2.) '2” SX Standard Mix Design Asphalt $1E:q {5; g/ _ITon Delivered to Canon City.

3.) Tack Oil $_.3. 50 /Gallon at the Plant.
Plant Location Address: 930 [ /. Bonneck ST Denver £0 802 14

4.) Tack Oil $ 3. 7.5 IGallon Delivered to Canon City.

Approximate date asphalt will be available: A) / / % o G;gm},}“ Fotw i mf”; a/

avallab;(;
Company Name: CO j’D; YLC 0 .—LZAC i
Phone Number: (3 Q 3 ) 2 ?é" 25 7 g

Signature: JZ: | WQ/UL/;@//L/

Date: ,warh‘ h 5,’ 28.3Y

>




FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
PURGHASE ORDER

FREMONT COUNTY COLORADO
615 MACON
CANON CITY, COLORADO 81212

onre 3R ooy

VENDOR: ALM N ?V W Yq (A

P.O. N° 41476

SHIP TO: (Department making request)

EEDOT

P

N Lod{ fdon B

L nn ( W (D FRI
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION ACCOUNT CODE UNIT PRIFE TOTAL
19506 Naak. Ol ATR0 L. /G 89795

TOTAL AMOUNT

1397, )

Colorado Sales Tax Exempt #98-04996

3-2/)-2y

Department Head

| certify that the articles requested hereon are necessary to conduct
properly the activities of this agency, the line-item account code is proper
and authorized within this Department Budget, and | have followed the

Fremont County Procurement Policy.

Date

County Manager Date
Date
Finance Officer Date

WHITE — Vendor Copy

YELLOW — Finance Office Copy

PINK — Department Copy




